
Contract Number CM2043 
Bid Number NC13-040 

CONTRACT FOR MEDICAL SUPPLIES 

THIS CONTRACT entered into this 24th day of March , 2014, by and 

between the BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS OF NASSAU COUNTY, 

FLORIDA, a political subdivision of the State of Florida, hereinafter referred to as "County", 

and BOUND TREE MEDICAL, LLC, 5000 Tuttle Crossing Boulevard, Dublin, OH 43016, 

hereinafter referred to as "Vendor". 

WHEREAS, the Board of County Commissioners of Nassau County, Florida opened 

sealed bids for Medical Supplies, Bid Number NC13-040, on September 26, 2013 at 10:00 a.m.; 

and 

WHEREAS, the Fire Rescue Department determined that Bound Tree Medical, LLC 

Healthcare, Inc. was the lowest, most responsive and responsible bidder for the bid items as set 

forth in Exhibit "A"; and 

NOW, THEREFORE, in consideration of the terms and conditions herein set forth, the 

County and the Vendor agree as follows: 

SECTION 1. Description of Services to be Provided 

The County does hereby retain the Vendor to furnish materials or services as further 

described in the Scope of Services attached hereto as Exhibit "B" and made a part hereof. 

Required materials and service shall be specifically enumerated, described and depicted in the 

Purchase orders authorizing performance of the specific task. This Contract standing alone does 

not authorize the performance of any work or require the County to place any orders for work. 

SECTION 2. Receiving/Payment/Invoicing 

No payment will be made for materials ordered without proper purchase order 

authorization. The County shall pay the vendor within forty-five ( 45) calendar days of receipt 

of invoice, pursuant to and in accordance with the promulgations set forth by the State of 

Florida's Prompt Payment Act. (Florida Statutes Section 218.70). Payment shall not be made 

until materials, goods or services have been received, inspected and accepted by the County in 

the quality and quantity ordered. Payment will be accomplished by submission of an invoice, in 

duplicate, with the Purchase Order number referenced thereon and mailed to the address set forth 

in the Purchase Order. Payment in advance of receipt of goods or services by Nassau County 

cannot be made. 
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The invoice submitted shall be in sufficient detail as to item, quantity and price in order 

for the County to verifY compliance with the awarded bid. 

SECTION 3. Acceptance of Goods/Services 

Receipt of goods/services shall not constitute acceptance. Final acceptance and 

authorization of payment shall be given only after a thorough inspection indicates that the 

product/performance meets bid specifications and conditions. Should the products/services 

differ in any respect fmm specifications, payment will be withheld until such time as the supplier 

takes necessary coiTective action. If the proposed corrective action is not acceptable to the 

County, the County Manager's Office may authorize the recipient to refuse fmal acceptance of 

the goods/services. Should a representative of the County agree to accept the goods/services on 

condition that the Vend or will correct his performance within a stipulated time period, then 

payment will be withheld until the services are performed as specified. 

SECTION 4. Inspection/Acceptance Title 

Inspection and acceptance will be at destination unless otherwise stipulated. Title and 

risk of loss or damage to all items shall be the responsibility of the Vendor until accepted by the 

using department of Nassau County, unless loss or damage results from negligence by Nassau 

County or it's using Department. 

SECTION 5. Firm Prices 

Plices for goods and services covered in the specifications shall be fi1m; net delivered to 

the ordering agency, F.O.B. DESTINATION, vendor paying all delivery costs and shall remain 

firm for the period of this Contract. No additional fees or charges shall be accepted. 

SECTION 6. Fund Availability 

This Contract is deemed effective only to the extent that appropriations are available. 

Pursuant to Florida Statutes all appropriations lapse at the end of the Fiscal Year. Multi-year 

awards shall be adequately funded but the County reserves the right not to appropriate for an 

ongoing procurement if it is deemed in its best interest. 

SECTION 7. Permits/Licenses/Fees 

Any permits, licenses or fees required for this service will be the responsibility of the 

Vendor unless otherwise stated. 
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SECTION 8. Taxes 
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The County is tax exempt. As such, the County will not pay any Federal Excise or State 

of Florida Sales Tax. The Vendor will refrain from including taxes in any billing. 

SECTION 9. Laws Governing this Contract 

This Contract shall be consistent with, and be governed by, the Ordinances of Nassau 

County, the whole law of the State of Florida, both procedural and substantive, and applicable 

federal statutes, rules and regulations. Any and all litigation arising under this Contract shall be 

brought in Nassau County, Florida. 

SECTION 10. Changes 

The County reserves the right to order, in writing, changes in the work within the scope 

of the contract, such as change in quantity or delivery schedule. The Vendor has the right to 

request an equitable price adjustment in cases where changes to the contract under the authority 

of this clause result in increased costs to the Vendor. 

SECTION 11. Modifications 

In addition to modifications made under the changes clause, this Contract may be 

modified within the scope of the contract upon the written and mutual consent of both parties, 

and approval by appropriate legal bodies in the County. 

SECTION 12. Assignment & Subcontracting 

The Vendor will not be permitted to assign its contract with the County, or to subcontract 

any of the work requirements to be performed without obtaining prior written approval by the 

County. 

SECTION 13. Severability 

If any section, subsection, sentence, clause, phrase, or portion of this Contract is, for any 
' 

reason, held invalid, unconstitutional, or unenforceable by any Court of Competent Jurisdiction, 

such portion shall be deemed as a separate, distinct, and independent provision, and such holding 

shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions thereof. 

SECTION 14. Termination for Default 

The performance of the Contract may be terminated by the County in accordance with 

this clause, in whole or in part, in writing, whenever the County shall determine that the Vendor 

has failed to meet performance requirement(s) of the Contract. 
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SECTION 15. Termination for Convenience 
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The County reserves the right to terminate the Contract in whole or part by giving the 

vendor written notice at least thhty (30) days prior to the effective date of the termination. Upon 

receipt of termination from the County, the Vendor shall only provide those services specifically 

approved or directed by the County. All other rights and duties of the pruties under the Contract 

shall continue during such notice period, and the County shall continue to be responsible to the 

vendor for the payment of any obligations to the extent such responsibility has not been excused 

by breach of default ofthe Vendor. 

SECTION 16. Force Majeure 

Neither party of this Contract shall be liable to the other for any cost or damages if the 

failure to perform the Contract arises out of causes beyond the control and without the fault or 

negligence ofthe parties. Such causes may include, but are not restricted to, acts of nature, fires, 

quarantine restriction, strikes and freight embargoes. In all cases, the failure to perform must be 

totally beyond the control and without any fault or negligence of the party. 

SECTION 17. Access and Audits 

The Vendor shall maintain adequate records to justify all charges, expenses, and costs 

incuned in pe1forming the Work for at least three (3) years after completion of this Contract. 

The County and the Clerk of Courts shall have access to such books, records, and documents as 

required in this Section for the purpose of inspection or audit during normal business hours, at 

the County's or the clerk's cost, upon five (5) days' written notice. 

SECTION 18. Vendor Responsibilities 

The Vendor will provide the services agreed upon in a timely and professional manner in 

accordance with specifications. 

SECTION 19. Public Emergencies 

The Vendor shall agree before, during, and after a public emergency, disaster, hurricane, 

tornado, flood, or other acts of nature that the County shall require a "First Priority" for goods and 

services. It is vital and imperative that the majority of citizens are protected from any emergency 

situation that threatens public health and safety, as determined by the County. The Vendor agrees to 

rent/selVlease all goods and services to the county or governmental entities on a "first priority" 

basis. The County expects to pay a fair and reasonable price for all products and services rendered 

or contracted in the event of a disaster, emergency, hunicane, tornado or other acts of nature. 
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SECTION 20. Period of Contract/Option to Extend or Renew 
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This Contract shall begin on the date of execution of this contract and terminate one year 

from the date of execution. The performance period of this Contract may be extended upon 

mutual Contract between the vendor and the County with no change in terms or conditions. 

Under this provision, three extensions of pe1formance period shall be allowed in one (1) year 

increments. Total contract length and individual one (1) year extensions shall not exceed four 

(4) years in total. Any Contract or amendment to the Contract shall be subject to fund 

availability and mutual written agreement between the County and the Vendor. 

SECTION 21. Exercise of Option 

Exercise of option to extend term of contract: If the County wishes to enter into an 

option period, the County shall request from the Vendor their written statement of desire to enter 

into an extension of the performance period. 

SECTION 22. Probationary Period 

The first ninety (90) days of this Contract are to be considered a "probationary" period. 

At the County's election, this Contract may be terminated, based on the performance of the 

Vendor, and a new award be granted without another formal bid. 

SECTION 23. Escalation Clause 

Ninety (90) days prior to the end of the contract term, the Vendor may request in writing 

an increase in an individual item unit cost. Consideration of price increases at each renewal 

period will be given provided such escalations are reasonable and acceptable to the County. It is 

also expected that de-escalation of prices will be extended to the County if market so reflects. 

The County will consider a price adjustment based on the latest Consumer Price Index and/or 

proof of a manufacturer's price increase. Any and all proposed increases are subject to approval 

by the County. 

SECTION 24. Supervision 

The Vendor shall act as an independent contractor and not as an employee of the County. 

The County shall not exercise any supervision or control over the Vendor's employees 

performing services under this Contract. Such employees shall be accountable not to the County, 

but solely to the Vendor, who in turn is responsible to the County. 
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SECTION 25. Indemnification and Insurance 
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The Vendor shall indemnify and hold hannless the County and its agents and employees 

from and against all claims, damages, losses and expenses, including attorney's fees, arising out 

of or resulting from the perfmmance of this contract, provided that any such claims, damage, loss 

or expense is attributable to bodily injury, sickness, disease or death, or to loss to or destruction 

of tangible property, including loss of use resulting therefi·om; and is caused in whole or in part 

by any negligent or willful act or omission of the Vendor and/or Subcontractor, anyone directly 

or indirectly employed by any of them or anyone for whose acts any of them may be liable. 

In any and all claims against the County or any of its agents or employees, by any 

employee of the Vendor, any Subcontractor, anyone directly or indirectly employed by any of 

them or anyone for whose acts any of them may be liable, the indemnification obligation shall 

not be limited in any way by any limitation on the amount or type of damages, compensation, or 

benefits payable by or for the Vendor or any Subcontractor under Workers' Compensation acts, 

disability benefit acts, or other employee benefits act. 

The vendor shall, on a primary basis, and at its sole expense, agree to maintain in full 

force and effect at all times during the life of this contract, insurance coverage's, limits, 

including endorsements, as described herein. The requirements contained herein, as well as the 

County's review or acceptance of insurance maintained by the Vendor is not intended to and 

shall not in any manner limit or qualify the liabilities and obligations assumed by the Vendor 

under the Contract. 

Workers' Compensation: The Vendor shall agree to maintain Workers' Compensation 

Insurance and Employers Liability in accordance with Florida Statute Chapter 440. Coverage 

must include Employers Liability with a minimum limit of$100,000 for bodily injury caused by 

an accident, each accident; $100,000 for bodily injury caused by a disease, each employee; 

$500,000 for bodily injury caused by a disease, policy limit. 

Business Auto Policy: The Vendor shall agree to maintain Business Automobile Liability 

at a limit of liability not less than $1,000,000 each occurrence for all owned, non-owned and 

hired automobiles. In the event the Vendor does not own any automobiles, the Business Auto 

Liability requirement shall be amended allowing the Vendor to agree to maintain only Hired and 

Non-Owned Auto Liability. This amended requirement may be satisfied by way of endorsement 

to the Commercial General Liability, or separate business auto coverage fmm. 
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Commercial General Liability: Commercial General Liability for public liability during the 

lifetime of this Contract shall have minimum limits of $1,000,000 each occurrence, $2,000,000 

General Aggregate; and $2,000,000 Products-Completed Operations Aggregate. Coverage shall 

include Premises and/or Operations, Independent Contractors, Products and/or Complete 

Operations, Personal and Advertising Liability, Contractual Liability and Broad Form Propetty 

Damage Endorsements. Coverage shall not contain an exclusion or limitation endorsement for 

Contractual Liability or Cross Liability. Coverage for the hazards of explosion, collapse and 

underground property damage (XCU) must also be included when applicable to the work to be 

performed. All insurance policies shall be issued from a company or companies duly licensed by 

the State of Florida. All policies shall be on an occurrence basis; the County shall not accept 

claims-made policies. Specific endorsements will be requested depending upon the type and 

scope of work to be performed. 

Additional Insured Requirements: Certificates showing proof of the above required insurance 

shall be provided to the County prior to start of this contract and shall be attached hereto as 

Exhibit "C". Except as to Workers' Compensation and Employers' Liability, said Certificate(s) 

shall clearly state that coverage required by the Contract has been endorsed to include Nassau 

County, a political subdivision of the State of Florida, its officers, agents and employees as 

Additional Insured with a CO 2026-Designated Person or Organization endorsement, or similar 

endorsement, to its Commercial General Liability. The name for the Additional Insured 

endorsement issued by the insurer shall read ''Nassau County, a political subdivision of the State 

ofFlorida, its officers, employees and agents". Above stated insurance policies will be endorsed 

to unequivocally provide thhty (30) days written notice to the County prior to any adverse 

changes, cancellation, or non-renewal of coverage thereunder. A copy of the policy 

endorsements must be included with the Certificate of Insurance. Said liability insurance must 

be acceptable by and approved by the County as to fmm and types of coverage. In the event that 

the statutory liability of the County is amended during the term of this Contract to exceed the 

above limits, the contractor shall be required, upon thirty (30) days written notice by the County, 

to provide coverage at least equal to the amended statutory limit of liability ofthe County. 

SECTION 26. Disputes 

Any dispute arising under this Contract shall be addressed by the representatives 

of the County and the Consultant as set fmth herein. Disputes shall be set forth in writing to the 
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County Manager with a copy to the Department Head or Consultant, depending on which party 

initiates the dispute, and provided by overnight mail, UPS, FedEx, or ce1tified mail. A response 

shall be provided in the same manner prior to the initial meeting with the County Manager, the 

Department Head (or their designee), and a representative of the Consultant. This initial meeting 

shall take place no more than thirty (30) days from the written notification of the dispute 

addressed to the County Manager. 

If the dispute is not settled at the initial meeting, the County Manager shall immediately 

notify the County Attorney. The Department Head (or his/her designee), the County Attorney, 

the County Manager, and the Department Head (or their designee(s)) shall meet with the 

Consultant's representative(s) within thirty (30) days of the County Manager's notification to the 

County Attorney of the continued dispute. 

If there is no satisfactory resolution, the claims, disputes, or other matters in question 

between the parties to this Agreement arising out of or relating to this Agreement or breach 

thereof, shall be submitted to mediation in accordance with mediation rules as established by the 

Florida Supreme Court. Mediators shall be chosen by the County and the cost of mediation shall 

be borne by the Consultant. If either party initiates a Court proceeding, and the Court orders, or 

the parties agree to, mediation, the cost of mediation shall be borne by the Consultant. 

Consultant shall not stop work during the pendency of mediation or dispute resolution. No 

litigation shall be initiated unless and until the procedures set f01th herein are followed. 

SECTION 27. Entire Agreement 

The written terms and provisions of this contract shall supersede all prior verbal 

statements of any official or other representative of the County. Such statements shall not be 

effective or be construed as entering into, or forming a part of, or altering in any manner 

whatsoever, this Contract or contract documents. 
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IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties have executed this contract on this day and year 

first above written. 

BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS 
NASSAU C 

Its: Chair 

Attest as to authenticity of the 
Chair's signature: 

Approved as to form and legality by the 
Nassau Count tto 

DAVID A. HALLMAN 
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STATE OF Ohio -------
COUNTY OF Franklin -------

Contract Number CM2043 
Bid Number NCI3-040 

BOUND TREE MEDICAL, LLC 

By~~ 
Its: Chief Financial Officer 

Before me personally appeared, Mark Dougherty • who is personally 
known _x _ or produced as identification, known to be the 
person described in and who executed the foregoing instrument, and acknowledged to and before 
me that he/she executed said instrument for the purposes therein expressed. 

ITNESS mx and and official seal, this 21 day of __ No_v•_mb_•r ____ , 2013. lkA_ - -
.~~~~~~~~~~~~ 

Notary-Public-State of (!) /Jro at large 

My Commission expires: 6/t%J/ /6:, J,.SlJ 
~ 
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EXHIBIT ''A'' 

MEDICAL SUPPLIES BID 
NO: NC13-040 

AWARD SPREADSHEET 



EXHIBIT "A" 

Bid Tabulation for Award Summary 
NC13-040 Medical Supplies 
Revised November 20,2013 

GROUPING RECOMMENDED VENDOR 
Airway Kentron Health Care 
Airway Equipment Boundtree Medical 
Airway, King System Q\!admed Boundtree Medical 
Airway Laryngoscope Southeastern Emergency Equipment 
Bandages Southeastern Emergency Equipment 
Bio-Waste Boundtree Medical 
Disposable Linen Boundtree Medical 
Fluids Boundtree Medical 
Immobilization Quadmed 
Instruments Kentron Health Care 
IV Supplies Boundtree Medical 
Monitoring Henry Schein 
Monitoring Equipment Boundtree Medical 
Monitoring Glucose Southeastern Emergency Equipment 
Monitoring Lifepak 12/15 Henry Schein 
Needles Henry Schein 
Oxygen Delivery Boundtree Medical 
Oxygen Equipment Kentron Health Care 
Pharmaceuticals Henry Schein 
PPE Quadmed 
Suction Henry Schein 
Syringes Henry Schein 
Twinpak No longer used- no award 



Bid Number NC13.Q40 
Medical Supplies 

Contract Management 
Prepared by Dawo Krass 

Bid Tabulation (Revised November 20, 2013) 
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Bids Opened 9126113 

Revised 11120/13 
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Bid Number NC13.o40 
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Bid Number NC13-040 
Medical Supplies 

Bid Tabulation (Revised November 20, 2013) Bids Opensd 9126113 

~ 
#VALUE $6.081 1 I$ 6.0800 I$ 121.6000 lEACH I $8.6: lr;~~~P-;;-.. ·-· I 20 I !No stD I I #VALUEt I #VALUEt leAcH I $S.o81 1 Is 6.o80o Is 121.6o00 leACH I $8.631 1 Is 8.63oo Is 112.sooo leAcH I $4.981 1 

168 Thermoscan 4 NO BID #VALUE! #VALUE! EACH $198.80 1 $ 198.8000 $ 795.20uu c"vn '"o•.<t • • " 
169 Thermoscan Covers 5000 NO BID #VALUE I #VALUE! BOX $15.56 200 $ O.ona $ 389.00"') lprw •~"" "'7.t 'ltv\ • n' 

!••~-~~ MONITORING GLUCOSE·'·"'''*"'' .-. ~<!'-~ l>'p;~J"'' ""'~- .•<·w;, :;..- ,,,.,, ·•''"' C:"'"~"'i">~•::O. ""'tVAtt:IE \!1$ >!!;"""'~ lcli.lllliM!'!;llll >'Cci'.....,C':i<:' ~··.Jl<l>'l<l'"l~ ' '1'•-<.<_~-126.52' lll.>'l\'11>;.;\1: ~--- • ilt2.a_; 75:32• ***"'~ >'-""'-"W"l 
170 Blood Glucose Monitor Precision Xtra 12 NO BID #VALUE! #VALUE! EACH $45.00 1 $ 45.0000 $ 540.0000 EACH $0.01 1 < ' 1001 e -Ol12DO• CASE $117.65 4 

'71 Blood Glucose Test Strips Precision Xtra 8000 NO BID #VALUE! #VALUE! BOX $21.63 50 $ 0.4326 $ 3,480.8000 BOX $17.97 50 ; 041 t 875.20001 BO~ """'" •• 
72 Blood Glucose Control s_olutions MediSens_e 14 NO BID #VALUE! #VALUE! EACH $8.98 1 $ 8.9800 $ 125.7200 NO BID 'll>t AtUD AI;UEUI!l Cl 

11.73 Haemolance ____ 50~ox . __ _ 24 ____ NO BID #VALUE! #VALUE! NO BID #VALUE! #VALUE! NO BID Oi!lt'/ALUEI VAa;UEitl!l B< 
IM .. \IAI;•U:=I~- <'IJ~ L_-:_· "~-._;,:,;~-~,;-;-;,------:;-F#VALQ~,~···· ,. ~.~;>_-.;,+~"'· ·.,.;.,:.t (i >,,:,;:::q'\--..>!~f,_.:~~,~-, --~I-S':i;.<;2&.048.00 1~\···" ''f'l\ll,IJ,~-n.··~l-:., "q.«J.il~""'·~~-1:1:>--;oo..,.-.n ......... , .. q 

1174 IDelibrillation Pad #VALUE! 

1175 IDefibrillation Pad 
!Adult, Edge System, 
- · · Combo Pad I 400 I INo BID I I #V~ 

176 E1C02 Nasal Canula 
FllterL 

5 ECG 12 lead cable 
5 ECG Main trunk 
CG NIBP 911 hose 
i Paper 

3one Morrow Needle 1/( 
>rrow Needle I/( 

~esdtes 

1ters Protective Plus 
1ters Protective Plus 
1ters Protective Plus 
1ters Protective Plus 
1ters Protective Plus 
tiers Protective Plus 

192 IAercisot Mask 
~erosol Mask 

!Aerosol Mask 
VM 

, Set w/ Med Mask 
Large Mask Only 

:t Filter 
5 "T" Adapter 

JasaiCanU 
Jasal Can 
lasal Can 
iebuiiZef 

~·-,.r:~"' 

CapnoUne 

100 
r,1 /':•'.: ~ :·>l·rf'i.:ri ... ·.;~ 

IX 

Ga 

I Adult 
Infant 
PediiiiiiC 
Adult 
PIN 313-7059X 

40 

PIN 313-7030 I 75 
PIN 313-7043 I 75 
P/N 313-2230 I 75 
Infant, non flared 
Pediatric, non flared 
Adult, non Hared 150i 

Infant 
Pediatric 

5i 
150 
1000 

~'£··" 
liE 
INC 

I ~·'· ... ;r>-:·~ I ~-'· ~~~ 

IVA 
IVA 
IVA 
IVA 
IVA 
#VAL 
#VAL 

"#vii[ 
#VALUE! 

~ ~ -~~. ')\~.!~ 

#VAL 
#VALUE! 
#VALUE! 
#VALUE! 
#VALUE! 
#VALUE! 
#VALUE! 

""iiViii::TEi 
""iiViii::TEi 
""iiViii::TEi 

#VALUE! 

#VALUE! IPAIR 

#VALUE! !PAIR 
#W 
#VP 

#VAL 
#VAL 
#VAL 
#VAL 

IVA 
IVA 
#VAL 
#VAL 
#VAL 
#VAL 
#VALUE! 
#VALUE! 
#VALUE! 

""iiVAVTiEi' 
""iiVAVTiEi' 

#VALUE! 

eACH 

-OX 
lOX 

JBOX 

SE 
§E 
§E 
§E 
§E 

I CASE 
CASE 

$49.281 1 

).531 1 

5o 
5o 

50 

TN( 

fBi 
fBi 
>BID 
$16.001 50 
$16.001 50 
$13.00 50 
$46.00 50 

$191.00 50 
$38.00 50 

5( 

I $ 49.28oo I s 9.856.oooo INOBID 

Is 4o.s3oo I s16,212.oooo 
#VALUE! #V~ 
#VALUE! #V~ 

"'16. 
9.8: 
9.87 

#VI 

1.86 
1.86 
1.86 
1.8600 
1.8600 
1:ii6oO 

12. 
!i:7c 

#VALUE 
#VALUE! 
#VALUE! 
#VALUE! 

0.3200 
0.3200 
0.2800 

Q.92ijQ 
3.8200 
0.7600 
0.7300 

,80.0000 

418.7500 18~ I $163.93 
78.9800 EACH 
78.9600 EACH 

744.0000 IBOX ± $86. 
1,116.0000 BOX _$86. 

2,79Q,oooo tsox- - _l_$86. 
2,790.0000 IBOX _L $86.67 

-1~488.0000 I BOX- I $86.6' 
1;116.0000 JBOX - I $86.67 

i c 
c 

1.8840 IEAC 
#VALUE! 
#VALUE! 

_!IVALUEI 
#VALUE! 

32.0000 I EACH 
48.0000 JEACH 

1 300.0000 EACH 
2.0000 EACH 
1.0000 EACH 

lOOO EACH 

$3.24 

$9.18 
INOBID 
INOBID 
INOBID 
Jt-IQ_BID 

$0.93 
).93 
).29 
).93 
1.1_6 

).92 

-JO_ 

50 
50 

.§Q_ 

.§Q_ 

.§Q_ 

2f 
100 

#VALUE! 

#Vo 

JEI 
JEI 
JEI 
JEI 

3930 
7.9400-

334 
334 

1.7334 
1.7334 
1.7334. 

1700 
filoo 

_#VALUE! 
_!11/ALUEI 

#VALUE! 
#VALUE I 

0.9: 
0.9: 
0.2! 
D.9: 

4. 

0.! 

#VALUE! 

#VAL 
liVI 
1M 

IN. 
#VI 
#V. 
#VI 

!PAIR 

I PAIR 

TEACH 
TEACH 
~ 
~ 
EACH 

JBOX 

384.8250 lEACH 
63.5200 EACH 
63.5200 EACH 

693.3600 EACH 
1 ,040.04Q<l EACH 
2,800.1000 lEACH 

- 2,600.1 000 I EACH-
1 ,386. 7200 I EACH 
1.040.0400 I EACH 

iOO IBOX 

#Vo 
IOOIEACH 

771.12001 EACH 
#VALUE! 
#VALUE! 
#VALUE! 
#VALUE! 

93.00 
139.50 

~ 
93. 

208.1 
199.50 
92 

,cH 
~H 

~H 

,cH 
,cH 

EACH 
EACH 

$44.37 

$36.91 
$13.96 

T1 
$127:69 
$319.24 
$51.87 
$9. 

$15.81 

1 

1 

1 
5 

·~ ;. ;.: 

$19.591 1 
$19.55 

1.6E 
L!!E 
1.6~ 

1.6~ 

1.6E 
1.6~ 

$2.431 100 
;<~ 

INOBIC 
$0.45 
$0.36 
14.35 
-14.35 
f.43 

!No au: 
INO BIC 
INOBIC 
{NO BIC 

I Adult 
' ~: ~;:;,_.~;I -11{\i-'1!( "~':t {tic ~_!~ !<' &·>'-• ,'-.,; .. ~1"'1·->'~>"·:'·,,,,::;,:,~ 

#VALUE! 
dVALUEi• 
""iiVAVTiEi' 

730.0000 JEACH 
f::t~t~\1;,<, ,.,;jl······ "\·,1 ~!~·-

1209 IBarbed_Fitting, Plasti 
Cylinder Wrench, Pia~'! 

l21flOxygeB_fittlng, olirlledi!_ 
1212 

!13 
!14 
!15 

•'"~~'•''.<"J!Jo "'t:lfl~ 

!16 !Adenosine 
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1118" Male NPT 
[178" Female NPl 

-15LPM 
'TslPM 
TsiPM 

l6mg, 2ml Vial 

.. To 
12 
6 
6 

12 

6 
;·:Yj '""t~·<• 

8( 

ill) 
)1jij') 
)1jij') 
)1jij') 

NOBIC 
NOBIC 
NOBJ[ 

_, ·~· ~~~~~,~;; 

""iiViiW'Ei 
#VALUE! 
#VALUE! 
#VALUE! 
#VALUE! 
#VALUE! 

"""iiViiiTiEi 
!l"t···>;.~,~. ···I,,;--~~ 

#VALUE! 

#VALUE I 
#VALUE! 
#VAl 
#W 
;m 
;m 

#W 

lEACH 

EACH 
EACH 
EACH 

1::~~~1·'1€> 

$0.89 
INOBIC 
!NOB 

$71.8~ 

$77.8~ 
$3'D.6c 

$6.2! 
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#VALUE! I #W 
Is o.89oo Is 

#VALUE! I _Ill/}_ 
#VALUE! I #V 

6.28( 

lEACH ).42 

lEACH cZ§ 
,cH 

r"'·""'"~'INo BIC #' #~ 

EACH 
EACH 
EACH 

EACH 
~ 
400~~~H 

).74 

INC 
1.1€ 

I 
INOBIC 
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Bid Number NC13.040 
Medical Supplies 

Bid Tabulation (Revised November 20, 2013) Bids Opened 9126/13 

1 
[22u 
(221 
~ 

~tropl~ 

~mmonia Inhalant 
~plrin, Chewable 
"repine Sulfate 
~alcium Chloride 
:harcoal 
;yanokit 5 G 
lextroseSO% 

I I >opamlne, DSW 
230Epinephrine.1:1ooo 

(233 (Giuca~ 
(234 (Giutos_ll_l§_ 
1235_ ltPrBtfoplum Bromide 0~9g5_o/o 
~ILabetalol 
[gR I Lidocaine 2% 
1238 IMaonesium Sulfate 
~ IMetoorolol 

laloxone 

'ropofol 
luelicln 

Ointment2% 
Tablets 

150m , 3ml Vial 
1m , 1 Ollll Lifeshieic[ 
~ 
81ma Bottle 

l1mg, 10ml Lifeshleld 
l1gm, 10ml Lifeshield 
150gm Bottle 

25 m 50ml Lifeshieid 
50mg Garpuject 
l400mg, 250ml 
1m1Ampule 

1ll1li_ 
~rPack 

(2.5m1Vial 
)Oma. 
lOma. 

lgm,2rr 
)mg,5rr 
1mg.2rr 
IOgm 

~ 
Lifeshleld 

fial 
fial 
Jfeshiek:f 

l.4mg tablets 
ng, 2ml iSecure 
lmg/ml, 50ml Vial 

~ 

150 
3oO 

28 
30 
40 
~0 

-~ 
-81 
~ 

NO BID 
NO BID 

(NO BID 

BIC 
BfE 
BIC 

(NOBIC 
NOBIC 
NOBIC 

(NOBIC 
(i'JO_BIC 
(NOBIC 

#VALUE! 
#VALUE I 
#VALUE I 

IVALUEI 
IVALUEI 
IVALUEI 
#VALUE I 
#VALUE I 
#VALUEL 
#VALUE I 
#VALl!l:l 
#VALUE I 

#VALUE! 
#Vj\LUE!_ 

~1\i,.UEI_ 
#VALUE I 
IVA 
IVA 
IVA 
IVA 

#VA 
#VA 

#iiiiL 
#VA 

#VA 
_#VA 
#VA 
#VA 
#VALUE 
#VALUE 

.UE 

EAG~ 

lliQlC_ 
!BOTTLE 
IEAGH 

EAGH 
(EAGH 

~ 
~ 

EAGH 

!BOTTLE 

5.9Q 1 $ 6.9ooo $ 552.ooo 
(i'JC #VALUE:!~ #VALUEI 

1.1~ U_______q.1120 I $ 8.960o 
).76 36 ~11$ 
,,45 

.25 
_$2.96 
$7.32 
$1.00 

(NO BID 
(NO BID 
(i'JQBID 
INOBIC 
INOBIC 
!NO~ 
INC 

1.75 
INC 

l.59l 25 
INC 

I$ s.450o I$ 
#VALUE! I #VI 
#VALUE! #VI 
#VALUE! #' 
#VALUE! #VI 
#VALUE! #VA 

r.3~ 
1.0[ 

_#VAL 
#VAL 
#VAL 
#VALUE I 
#VALUE I 
IN. 
#VA 

Is 315.0000 
$ 888.0000 
$ 2 928.0000 
$ 200.0000 

#VALUjOI 
__IIYALUEI 

#VALUE I 

I :#VA 

oo I$ )00 

I$ 140 
#VA #V 

NO BID 
NO BID 

(NO BID 

) Btl 
) BH 
) BH 

(NOBIC 
NOBIC 
NOBle 

(NOBIC 
(NO Bl[ 
(NOBIC 

#VALUE I 
IVA 
IVA 
IVA 
IVA 
IVA 
IVA 
IVA 
IVA 
IVAI 
#VAl 
#VALUE! 
#VALUE I 
#VALUE I 
#VALUE I 
#VALUEl 
#VALUE I 

#VALUE I 
#VALUE I 
#VALUE I 

#VA 
#VA 

#VA 
#VAiiiEi 

#VALUE I 
_ftVALUEI 

#VALUE I 
#VALUE I 
#VALUE! 
!VALUE 

UE 
UE 
UE 
UE 
iJE 

~.;,~~~~~i~:al I 5o I INo BID I I #VALUEr I #VALUEI IEAGH I $9.951 1 Is 9.95oo Is 497.5ooo I INo BID I I #VALUEI I #VA 
dlum Bicarbonate 8.4% 50ml Lifeshield 100 NO BID #VALUE! #VALUEI EAGH $7.42 1 $ 7.4200 $ 742.0000 NO BID #VALUEI #VA 
iu-Medrol 125ma, 2mf Vial 75 NO BID #VALUEI #VALUEI EAGH $6.93 1 $ 6.9300 $ 519.7500 NO BID #VALUEI #VA 

l Btc 
lBiC 
l BIC 

(NO BID 
NO BID 
NO BID 
(NO BID 
(NOBIC 
(NOBIC 

rbulallne 1mg, 1ml Vial 80 NO BID #VALUEI #VALUEI NO BID #VALUEI #VALUEI NO BID #VALUEI #VALu~• ,.v oou 
'E""'.~~="~:\ ·;< -:~'Y>i.·;""#.'~:;>f>f' 'i\ ·.;1"-:.t~ ~~.~4,11>' '4":."<:.1'-t~ ~)":.t?',v-~',_4 ··.(~'t'~· ''/'!if' t~fl'~"'''~i:ll"~-~,.·,:·''j,t:'. •:''r'·,·"~·-~:-,>;;,.;:;_:;, ':r,~"':tVAlUE ~ 1!'\,','<f!~}:'rJ'I~.J· ~~ !Jt.'lri.'!-f?l~ 1-g:+-,.'d""l~!.~ 1~$~~~59.03. <1'1"*~:4:*'~ ~~~Y~. ~~e- ."""';:t'~ i$~.;..~455~82 :~"4· ,"',Hi! I·:•·. '*' 
!rmicidal DisJlQ~'lbleWipes 160perTub 24 NO BID #VALUEI ~ __ #VALUEI TUB $6.52 160 $ _ 0~0408 $ 0.9780 TUB $5,34 160 L___()Jl~ $ 0.8010 ~UB $5.52 160 

1251 (Gloves, Sm_all ~ling Xlra Nitrile I 80 I_ (NO BID_ I_ I #VALI,JE! _I #VALUEI__l__ _ (NO BID l____I_IIVALUEI l___!\/_ALUEI (BOX -__L_$9.57( 100 (~57($ i:IIS§QJIJQX I _ $10.23l__!QQ_ 
(252 (Gfove~<Odium __j§!e_rtinJl Xtra Nitrile ____L_2oo u I _jfliQ_BJ()_( I #VAL[JE! I IIVALUEI_l______ (NO BID l____l _#VALUEI I IIVAL[JEI (BOX __j____j~,5]1__100 I$ 0.0957( $ 19.1400 (BOX _I _ $10.23l__!QQ_ 
1:15_3 (Gloves, Large IStertlng Xtra Nitrile I 500 I (NO BID I I #VALUE! I #VALI,JE;I I (NO Bl[} I I #VALUEI I #VALUEI (BOX ~ I $9.571 100 LS 0.09571 $ 47.8500 !BOX I__ $10.23l__l_QQ_ 
~(Gloves, X-Large (Starting Xtra Nitrile I 400 I (NO BID I I #VALUE! I #VALUEI I (NO BID I I IIVALUEI I #VALUE! (BOX I $9.57( 100 I$ 0.0957( $ 38.2800 (BOX I $10.23 
(255 (Mask. Molded Pre-Formed I I 100 I (NO BID I I #VALUE! I #VALUEI (BOX I $4.70( 50 I$ 0.0940 I$ 9.4000 (BOX I $3.69( 50 __ I$ 0.0738 LL 7.38QQ_JC:I\SE I $71.42l__l_QQQ_ 
(256 (N95 Respirator (PIN 9211 I 28 I (NO BID I I #VALUE! I #VALUEI (BOX I $15.39( 10 I$ 1.5390 I$ 43.0920 (EAGH I $2.34( 1 ($ 2.3400 I$ 6~l:5200 (GASE I $182A21 120 
Lg§LI_O._B.Kits,LalexFree I I 14 I (NOBID I I #VALUEI I #VALUEI (EACH I $6.10( 1 ($ 6.1000($ 85.4000(EAGH I $4.11( 1 ($ 4.1100($ 57.5400(EACH I $4.89 
(258 (Protective Gown I I 14 I (NO BID I I #VALUEI I #VALUEI JGASE I $16.50( 50 I$ 0.3300 I$ 4.6200 (PACK I $3.67( 10 I$ 0.3670 I$ 5.1380 (BAG I $10.621 15 

>leclive Shoe Covers I I 14 I I No BID I I #VALUE! I #VALUE! leASE I $9.251 150 I$ 0.06171 $ 0.8633IGASE I $15.741 150 I$ 0.10491 $ 1.4691 leASE I $13.791 300 
ve Sleeves I I 28 I \NO BID I I #VALUEI I #VALUEI IGASE I $13.121 100 I$ 0.1312 I$ 3.6736IBOX I $47.561 100 I$ 0.4756 I$ 13.3168IGASE I $70.80 
:are Hand Sanitizer 17 oz I 50 I INO BID I I #VALUE I I #VALUEI I INO BID I I #VALUEI I #VALUEI IGASE I $42.871 12 I$ 3.5725 I$ 178.6250 IGASE I $53.46 
:are Holder 17 oz I 14 I )NO BID I I #VALUE I I #VALUE! I !NO BID I I #VALUEI I #VALUE! I )NO BID I I #VALUEI I #VALUEI IGASE INa Ghar 

ouo Glasses MeelsANSIZ87.1 10 NOBID #VALUE! #VALUE! BOX $11.00 10 $ 1.1000 $ 11.0000 EAGH $1.31 1 $ 1.3100 $ 13.1000IEAGH I $3.1" 
ICTION~l$:~.:-, ••• ;~~i<<•'-1l\\O t~'*"'•'<,_,ll>ll.-w.>~• .,.;;;;:;,,,,w ,- '""""·""":~(; :i!illl'' . '#VAI!Ut::lll'!1 iil\t.il!(l'ili;;; ~ -~ Sl'<'-"<'*297:50' lf'!!"C~ i<i'>ll~Wi"'f 'l'.>i;;Jr~ lll.'l!l~ t·$~378)1Dll""~~l<··b(•i>•'li>'lil'~"'-'·"" 
lb Syrin e 2 Ounce 10 NO BID #VALUE I #VALUEI EAGH $0.88 1 $ 0.8800 $ 8.8000 EACH $0.31 1 $ 0.3100 $ '·~n o•r-u •n" • 

!econium Aspirator 10 NO BID #VALUEI #VALUEI EAGH $3.97 1 $ 3.9700 $ 39.7000 EAGH $3.93 1 $ 3.9300 $ 
:Tube 8 FA 20 NO BID #VALUE! #VALUEI NO BID #VALUEI #VALUEI NO BID #VALUEI #VALUE! TEACH 
:Tube 12FR 20 NOBID #VALUEI #VALUE! NOBID #VALUE! #VALUEI EACH $2.16 1 $ 2.1600 $ 43.2000 EACH 

ic Tube $ 2:1600- $ 43.2000 EAGH 
1270 (Safe-T-Vac Suction Catheter #VALUE I #VALUE I EAGH 
1271 (SaiO:T-Va<:_~tJQtion Catheter __ j10FR I 20 I _(NO BID I I _IIVALUEI I #VALUEI I (NO BID I I #VALUE I I #VALUE I I (NO BID I I #VALUE! I #VALUE I (EACH 
I272JSate,T-VacSuctionCathe1er (14FR- ---____L_2o~r---___li'j_O_BID-~ #VALl)Ei( #VALUEI_( (NOBID j __ ~ -1 #VALUEI I -#VALUE! I --TNOBID I I _#VALUE!( #VALUEI__(EACI-f 
ill:L(Sale~T-Vac Suction Cathe!f!r-~- (18 FA -~----__j~g_~--- (NO BID_[~ #VALUE[]_ #VALUEi__l______::_ (NO BID I .. --T-/tVALUEI I ~· #IIA~UEI I (NOBj[)__L_ I #VAl.UEI-1 _#VALUEI (EAGH 
1274 (Suction Canister (1200cc I SO I (NO BID I I #VALUEI I #VALUE-I (EAGH I _ $3.09( 1 I$ 3.0900 I$ 185.4000 (EAGH I $3.01( 1 I$ 3.0100 I$ 180.6000 (EAGH 
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EXHIBIT "B" 

ATTACHMENT "A" -TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS 

1. The successful bidder shall extend these prices to any other county, or any 
agency within Nassau County, upon request of the using agency. 

2. When there is a specific item description and I or specific brand requested 
no substitutes will be accepted. 

3. Attached is the list of required items for agencies involved. 

4. The bidders shall make all products available for review and approval 
upon request prior to acceptance of the bid or products. 

5. Any backordered item shall be fulfilled within 14 calendar days from the 
date of the back-order; otherwise the back ordered items will be canceled 
and procured from other sources. 

6. Nassau County reserves the right to award the bid per item or as a group. 

7. Bid prices shall be binding, with the county reserving the right to buy 
additional items for a period of two years. 

8. No Latex containing product will be accepted without specific written 
agreement. 

9. Unless otherwise specified, all equipment bid shall be engineered to avoid 
needle sticks or self sheathing. This includes all needles, IV Catheters, 
Scalpels. 

10. All pre-filled medication shall be compliant with the Baxter Interlink 
administration system. 

11. Any item(s) marked with"*" requires a sample be submitted for review. 

12. Delivery of all items should be expected within 5 work days from receipt 
of order by the vendor. Any item(s) requiring longer than 5 days shall be 
communicated in written format to Tactical Support; Nassau County Fire 
Rescue. 

13. All bid information shall be contained on the bid price sheet provided. 
Any explanation shall be made on separate paper with the item specified. 

14. There is no requirement to bid on all items, nor is there minimum number 
of items required to be bid upon. 

15. All pharmaceuticals will be awarded as a group bid. This will include 
lines 216-249. 


